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January 30, 2024 

 
 
 

Dear Sponsor: 
 

Friends of Joe W. Brown Memorial Park & Louisiana Nature Center, "Friends" and New Orleans East Matters 
Coalition, in partnership with Event Experts, is sponsoring the 3rd Annual Nola East Festival, Saturday, 
September 21, 2024 in Joe W. Brown Park. As a nonprofit organization, "Friends" is requesting your support, 
and sponsorship, to assist in providing this much needed entertainment opportunity for the community. One of 
the primary goals of our festival is to bring together neighborhoods, businesses, schools, churches, and 
community organizations, to enjoy the culture of local musicians, artists, and cuisine, in the natural 
environment of Joe W. Brown Park. The success of this event depends upon the support of sponsors, partners, 
businesses, neighborhood and community organizations, and volunteers, who assist with in kind as well as 
monetary donations. 

 
This family fun event will also feature a youth stage, children's entertainment, school bands, and amusements. 
A variety of Vendor opportunities are available, and food vendors will be featured in our special "Nola East 
Festival Food Court." 

 
A major objective of our 3rd Annual Nola East Festival is to present a fundraising opportunity to bring a history 
making signature Carousel, a piece of fine artistry, and culture, to Joe W. Brown Memorial Park. The carousel 
will create a positive impact on our quality of life through increased youth and family enjoyment, as well as 
adding a unique opportunity for economic development in Eastern New Orleans. 

By participating as a sponsor, your organization will benefit by exposure through media, advertising, website, social 
media, and promotional efforts in support of Friends of Joe W. Brown Park 3rd Annual NOLA East Festival. In 
addition, your donation will afford you special invitation and recognition at all events and activities. Monetary 
donations by check, please make payable to Friends of Joe W. Brown Park. For further information, please 
contact Tangee Wall at (504)427-2596, email tangeyon@yahoo.com., PO Box 871852, New Orleans, La 70187. 

Thank you in advance for your support and sponsorship of Friends of Joe W. Brown Memorial Park & Louisiana 
Nature Center and the 3rd Annual Nola East Festival in contributing to a better quality of life and making a 
positive difference in our community. 

 

Tangee Wall Executive Director 
Friends of Joe W. Brown Memorial Park & La Nature Center 
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